o

D k00

COUNCIL AGENDA
CITY OF CARTHAGE, MISSOURI
TUESDAY, MARCH 10, 2020
6:30 P.M. - COUNCIL CHAMBERS

Call to Order

Invocation

Pledge of Allegiance to Flag

Calling of the Roll

Reading and Consideration of Minutes of Previous Meeting

Presentations/Proclamations

Public Comments

(Each person addressing the Council shall state their name and address or the organization or firm represented and is limited to no more than five
(5) minutes. The time may be extended by the chair if deemed necessary. Once a person has had their say on a particular issue they are not permitted
to once again speak on the issue unless called to answer any further questions by the Council or Chair)

8. Reports of Standing Committees

9. Reports from Special Committees and Board Liaisons

10. Report of the Mayor

11. Reports/Remarks of Councilmembers
(Each Councilmember is limited to no more than two (2) minutes. The time may be extended by the Chair if deemed necessary. Once a
Councilmember has had their say on a particular issue they are not permitted to once again speak on the issue unless permitted by the Chair)

12. Administrative Reports

13. Report of Claims Presented Against the City

14.Public Hearings

15.0Id Business

16. New Business

1.

C.B. 20-07 — An Ordinance authorizing the Mayor to execute a Contract between the City of
Carthage, Missouri and CDL Electric of Pittsburg, Kansas for lighting improvements and
upgrades at City Hall. (Public Works)

C.B. 20-08 - An Ordinance adopting and amending APPENDIX H (Signs) of the International
Building Code/2006. (Public Works)

C.B. 20-09 — An Ordinance authorizing the Mayor to execute a Contract between the City of
Carthage, Missouri and G&G Construction Co. Inc., of Carthage, Missouri for the River Street
Widening and Storm water Improvements project in an amount not to exceed $241,016.14.
(Public Works)

C.B. 20-10 — An Ordinance authorizing the Mayor to execute a Contract between the City of
Carthage, Missouri and Sprouls Construction, Inc., of Lamar, Missouri for Storm water
Improvement projects in an amount not to exceed $207,240.00. (Public Works)

C.B. 20-11 — An Ordinance vacating a portion of an alley running North (from approximately
286 feet to 460 feet) off Centennial Street between Grand Avenue and Clinton Street, between
1429 S Clinton and 1500 Grand Avenue in Carthage Miscellaneous Addition, in the City of
Carthage, Missouri. (Public Works)



17.Mayor's Appointments

18. Resolutions

1. Resolution 1896 — A Resolution providing for the formal acceptance of a donation by the
City Council of the City of Carthage, Missouri pursuant to City Policy. (Public Safety)

19. Closing Comments
20. Executive Session

21. Adjournment

PERSONS WITH DISABILITIES WHO NEED SPECIAL ASSISTANCE CALL 417-237-7000 (VOICE) OR 1-
800-735-2466 (TDD VIA RELAY MISSOURI) AT LEAST 24 HOURS PRIOR TO MEETING









marketing assistance, comprised of federal funds to be expended for Commission-
approved transit projects was placed on second reading followed by a roll call vote of 10
yeas and 0 nays. Ayes: Armstrong, Barlow, Collier, Daugherty, Harrison, Newport,
Otero, Snow, Topete and West. The council bill was approved and numbered
Ordinance 20-03.

C.B. 20-03 — An Ordinance extending the current agreement with Blevins Asphalt
Construction Co., Inc. for the Annual Asphalt Paving Contract (@ $58.55 per ton of
asphalt to include tack oil) to include a new term from July 1, 2020 to June 30, 2021
was placed on second reading followed by a roll call vote of 10 yeas and 0 nays. Ayes:
Armstrong, Barlow, Collier, Daugherty, Harrison, Newport, Otero, Snow, Topete and
West. The council bill was approved and numbered Ordinance 20-04.

C.B. 20-04 — An Ordinance to amend Section 23 of the Code of the City of Carthage by
adding section 23-431, Municipal Parking Lot Regulations was placed on second
reading followed by a roll call vote of 4 yeas and 6 nays. Ayes: Barlow, Harrison, Otero,
Topete. Nays: Armstrong, Collier, Daugherty, Newport, Snow and West. The Council
Bill failed.

C.B. 20-05 — An Ordinance authorizing the Mayor to execute an Agreement between
Morris Strom for professional labor that will manage the Nexedge Radio System as it
affects the operation of those city departments who function within the city limits of the
City of Carthage and the Carthage Fire Department whose operational area includes
the city and the fire district was placed on second reading followed by a roll call vote of
10 yeas and 0 nays. Ayes: Armstrong, Barlow, Collier, Daugherty, Harrison, Newport,
Otero, Snow, Topete and West. The council bill was approved and numbered
Ordinance 20-05.

Under New Business, C.B. 20-06 — An Ordinance authorizing the Mayor to enter into a
contract with Riverside Fireworks LLC for fireworks display for the July 4, 2020, July 4,
2021 and July 4, 2022 celebration in the amount not to exceed $44,850.00 was placed
on first reading with no action taken.

During closing remarks, Mr. Daugherty extended his condolences to the Snow and Rife
families, Mr. Newport expressed his desire to conduct a Mock Council Meeting in
conjunction with Student Council Day, and Mr. Barlow thanked first responders for what
they do.

Mr. West made a motion, seconded by Mr. Collier, to adjourn the regular session of the
Council Meeting. Motion carried and meeting adjourned at 7:11 PM.

Dan Rife, Mayor


















COUNCIL BILL NO. _20-07 ORDINANCE NO.

An Ordinance authorizing the Mayor to execute a Contract between the City of Carthage, Missouri
and CDL Electric of Pittsburg, Kansas for lighting improvements and upgrades at City Hall.

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF CARTHAGE, JASPER
COUNTY, MISSOURI as follows:

SECTION I: The Mayor of the City of Carthage is hereby authorized to execute a Contract
between the City of Carthage, Missouri and CDL Electric of Pittsburg, Kansas for lighting
improvements and upgrades at City Hall, which Contract is attached hereto and incorporated
herein as if set out in full.

SECTION II: This ordinance shall take effect and be in force from and after its passage and
approval.

PASSED AND APPROVED THIS DAY OF March 2020.
Dan Rife, Mayor

ATTEST:

Traci Cox, City Clerk

Sponsored by: Public Works Committee






COUNCIL BILL NO. _ 20-08 ORDINANCE NO.

An ordinance adopting and amending APPENDIX H (Signs) of the International Building
Code/2006.

Section I: The publication known as the International Building Code/2006 Appendix H,
as published and by the International Code Council, Inc. and amended is hereby adopted for the
control, installation, and placement of signs herein provided; and each and all of the regulations,
provisions, penalties, conditions, amendments, and terms of said Appendix H are hereby referred
to, adopted, and made part hereof as fully set out in ordinance, with additions, insertions, deletions,
and changes, prescribed in Section 111 of this ordinance.

Section II: That the International Building Code/2000 Appendix Hand all other ordinances
or parts of ordinances in conflict herewith are hereby repealed.

Section III:
Section H101.2 DELETE: 1. Painted nonilluminated signs.
Section H104 DELETE: Identification (complete section)
Section H107.1.3 DELETE: Area Limitations (complete Section)
Section H110.4 DELETE: Height of open signs (complete section)
Section H110.5 DELETE: Height of closed signs (complete section)
Section H113 DELETE: Marquee signs (complete section)
Section H106.1 DELETE: ICC and INSERT: NEC
Section H106.2 DELETE: ICC and INSERT: NEC
Section H107.1.2 DELETE: 200 square feet INSERT: 120 square feet
Section H109.1 DELETE: greater than 100 feet (30,480 mm) INSERT: 45 feet
Section H110.3 DELETE: solid INSERT: Roof
Section H110.3 DELETE: having a solid surface

Section H109 INSERT: H109.4 Ground signs shall be permitted only when they
advertise products or services sold on the premises on which said sign is located; when
they advertise products or services sold by the owner of the ground sign; or when they
display directions or advertise information about public places; historic homes; historic
sites; historic districts; historic museums; municipal buildings; and hospitals, etc.



H109.5 Ground signs with two (2) faces or less shall not have more than 120 square
feet per face, except those located along four lane divided, limited access highways.
Ground signs located along said highways shall not have more than 200 square feet per
face.

H109.6 Ground signs with multiple faces constructed on either side or on the same
side of uprights or supports shall not have more than 120 square feet per side.

H109.7 Ground signs having three (3) or four (4) faces attached to the same upright
or supports at the same elevation shall not have more than 50 square feet per face. Messages
board areas which are 60 square feet or less that are located on the same uprights or
supports of any ground sign, shall not be considered to be part of the sign face. Message
board areas of more than 60 square feet located on the same uprights or supports shall not
be allowed.

H109.8 No more than one (1) ground sign shall be allowed for commercial or non-
commercial premises on which said signs are located, unless said premises lie adjacent to
more than one city street, county highway, state highway, or federal highway. No more
than one (1) additional ground sign shall be allowed in such cases.

SECTION IV: This Ordinance shall take effect and be in force from and after its passage
and approval.

PASSED AND APPROVED THIS __ DAY OF , 2020.

Dan Rife, Mayor
ATTEST:

Traci Cox, City Clerk
Sponsored by: Public Works Committee
























COUNCIL BILL NO. _20-09 ORDINANCE NO.

An Ordinance authorizing the Mayor to execute a Contract between the City of Carthage, Missouri
and G&G Construction Co. Inc., of Carthage, Missouri for the River Street Widening and Storm
water Improvements project in an amount not to exceed $241,016.14.

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF CARTHAGE, JASPER
COUNTY, MISSOURI as follows:

SECTION I: The Mayor of the City of Carthage is hereby authorized to execute a Contract
between the City of Carthage, Missouri and G&G Construction Co. Inc., of Carthage, Missouri for
the River Street Widening and Storm water Improvements project in an amount not to exceed
$241,016.14, pursuant to bid specifications and recommendation, which Contract is attached
hereto and incorporated herein as if set out in full.

SECTION II: This ordinance shall take effect and be in force from and after its passage and
approval.

PASSED AND APPROVED THIS DAY OF September 2020.

Dan Rife, Mayor

ATTEST:

Traci Cox, City Clerk

Sponsored by: Public Works Committee



AGREEMENT FORM ..ouniveriimisisisssasnssisisdioiiiessssiiisias itnmss seserasssnsss s trssesmeseas et ss nessansspansassesnymssgnassones 00500
THIS AGREEMENT, made this day of , 2020, by and between City of Carthage,

Carthage, Missouri, hereinafter called "OWNER" and _G & G Construction Co., Inc. doing business as (an
individual), or (a-partrership,) or (a corporation) hereinafter called "CONTRACTOR".

WITNESSETH: That for and in consideration of the payments and agreements hereinafter mentioned:

1. The CONTRACTOR will commence and complete the construction of River Street Widening and
Stormwater, Carthage, Missouri.

2. The CONTRACTOR will furnish all of the materials, supplies, tools, equipment, labor and other
services necessary for the construction and completion of the PROJECT describedherein.

3. The CONTRACTOR will commence the work required by the CONTRACT DOCUMENTS on the date
stipulated in the NOTICE TO PROCEED and will complete the same within ninety (90) calendar days unless
the period for completion is extended otherwise by the CONTRACT DOCUMENTS.

4. The CONTRACTOR understands that the specifications governing the work contemplated are attached
to this proposal.

5. The CONTRACTOR agrees to pay, without condition or recourse, as liquidated damages to the sum of
Five Hundred and 00/100 dollars ($500.00) for each consecutive calendar day after the stated DATE OF
COMPLETION or extension thereto that the CONTRACTOR shall be in default as provided in SECTION
15 OF THE General Conditions. CONTRACTOR further agrees to reimburse the subcontractors, suppliers,
engineers, and other contractors of the OWNER for costs incurred and/or damages suffered by reason or
reasons attributable to the CONTRACTOR'S failure to complete the CONTRACT by the completion date,
or extensions thereof, as provided by section 15 of the General Conditions. Said liquidated damages and
payments shall be withheld from the payments due the contractor. The CONTRACTOR agrees to perform
all of the WORK described in the CONTRACT DOCUMENTS and comply with the terms therein for the

sum of Two Hundred Forty-One Thousand Sixteen and 14/100 Dollars ($241,016.14).

6. Theterm "CONTRACT DOCUMENTS" means and includes the following:
(A) Invitation to Bid
) lnstruchons to Bidders

D) Bid Bond

E) AgreementForm

F) Notice of Award

G) Notice to Proceed

H) Performance Bond

1) Paymentbond

J) General Conditions of Contract

K) SupplementaryConditions

L) Specifications prepared by Anderson Engineering, Inc. and dated February, 2020.

M) Drawings prepared by Anderson Engineering, Inc. and dated February, 2020.

(B
(
(
(
(
(
(
(
(
(
(
(
(

N) Addenda
No. 1 dated February 12 20 20
No. 2 dated February 14 2020
No. 3 dated February 24 2020
No. dated 20
No. dated 20

00500-1



7. The OWNER will pay to the CONTRACTOR in the manner and at such times as set forth in the General
Conditions such amounts as required by the Contract Documents.

8. This Agreement shall be binding upon all parties hereto and their respective heirs, executors,
administrators, successors, and assigns.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties hereto have executed, or caused to be executed by their duly

autharized officials, this Agreement in three (3) copies each of which shall be deemed an original on the
date first above written.

OWNER:
City of Carthage
(SEAL) By
Attest Name Dan Rife
(Please Type or Print)
Name Traci Cox Title Mayor
Title City Clerk
CONTRACTOR:
(SEAL) By
Attest Name Curtis Garner
(Please Type or Print)
Name Title President

00500-2






NOTICE TO PROCEED

....................................................................................................................... 00502
TO: G & G Construction Co., Inc.
P.O. Box 863
Carthage, Missouri 64836
DATE:
PROJECT: _River Street Widening and Stormwater
You are hereby notified to commence WORK in accordance with the Agreement dated .
2020, on or before , 2020, and you are to complete the WORK within ninety (90)
calendar days thereafter. The date of completion of all WORK is therefore , 2020.
City of Carthage
By:
Title:___Mayor

ACCEPTANCE OF NOTICE
Receipt of the above NOTICE TO PROCEED

is hereby acknowledged by

this the day of , 20

By

1-1



COUNCIL BILL NO. _20-10 ORDINANCE NO.

An Ordinance authorizing the Mayor to execute a Contract between the City of Carthage, Missouri
and Sprouls Construction, Inc., of Lamar, Missouri for Storm water Improvement projects in an
amount not to exceed $207,240.00.

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF CARTHAGE, JASPER
COUNTY, MISSOURI as follows:

SECTION I: The Mayor of the City of Carthage is hereby authorized to execute a Contract
between the City of Carthage, Missouri and Sprouls Construction, Inc., of Lamar, Missouri for
Storm water Improvement projects in an amount not to exceed $207,240.00, pursuant to bid
specifications and recommendation, which Contract is attached hereto and incorporated herein as
if set out in full.

SECTION II: This ordinance shall take effect and be in force from and after its passage and

approval.

PASSED AND APPROVED THIS DAY OF March 2020.
Dan Rife, Mayor

ATTEST:

Traci Cox, City Clerk

Sponsored by: Public Works Committee









NOTICE OF AWARD. ovvumcrsvsmsns sz s s i i i o S i S e 00501

TO: Sprouls Construction, Inc.

397 W. Hwy DD

Lamar, Missouri 64759

PROJECT Description: College Avenue Curb and Stormater, Highland Avenue to St. Louis Avenue Drainage
Improvements, Airport Drive to Gene Taylor Drive Storm Sewer Improvements and 4" and Maple Streets

Storm Sewer Improvements, Carthage, Missouri.

The OWNER has considered the BID submitted by you for the above described WORK in response
to its Invitation to Bid dated February 5, 2020 and Instructions to Bidders.

You are hereby notified that you BID has been accepted in the amount of Two Hundred Seven
Thousand Two Hundred Forty and 00/100 Dollars ($207,240.00).

You are required by the Instructions to Bidders to execute the Agreement and furnish the required
CONTRACTORS PERFORMANCE BOND, PAYMENT BOND and CERTIFICATES OF INSURANCE
within fourteen (14) consecutive calendar days from the date of this Notice to you.

If you fail to execute said Agreement and to furnish said BONDS and INSURANCE
CERTIFICATES within fourteen (14) consecutive calendar days from the date of this Notice, said OWNER
will be entitled to consider all your rights arising out of the OWNER'S acceptance of your BID as
abandoned and as a forfeiture of your BID BOND. The OWNER will be entitled to such other rights as may
be granted by law.

You are required to return an acknowledged copy of this NOTICE OF AWARD to the OWNER.

Dated this day of , 20
City of Carthage
By:
Title:___Mayor
ACCEPTANCE OF NOTICE

Receipt of the above NOTICE OF AWARD is hereby acknowledged by
this the day of 20

By

Title

501-1





















CITY ADMINISTRATOR DONATION REPORT:

The City Administrator shall prepare a report evaluating the impact of all proposed donations or
grants on the resources of the City. This report must include both the immediate costs of placing
said donation into service or program into action and the costs required to maintain or continue the
program in future budget years. Such costs may include analysis of annual personnel, repair and
maintenance and equipment expenditures and any future capital improvements required by the
donation. The report must be submitted to Council at the same time acceptance of the donation or
grant is to be considered. If additional operating costs are associated with the acceptance of the
donation, the Council shall identify the source of revenues to defray the additional costs at the time
of acceptance.

There will be on-going costs associated with the operations of the equipment which will be
handled through the Police Department’s operating budget.


















discussion, Ceri Otero made a motion to approve the bid submitted by G&G Construction. All
ayes, motion carried.

Consider and discuss a contract between City and Sprouls Construction on various stormwater
improvements — College Avenue curb and stormwater, Highland Avenue to St. Louis drainage
improvements, and Airport Drive to Gene Taylor Drive storm sewer improvements. Bids were
opened on February 26™ for these projects. The engineer’s estimate listed was at $217,000.
Sproul’s Construction submitted the low bid of $207,240 and no cents. Engineer’s and city staff
recommendation is to accept the low bid of $207,240 and no cents submitted by Sproul’s
Construction. After discussion, Ceri Otero made a motion to approve the bid submitted by
Sproul’s Construction. All ayes, motion carried.

Other Business:

Discuss letter from Anderson Engineering regarding engineering and survey services for Vaughn
Company, Inc for a proposed subdivision located south of Chapel Estates. Zeb gave a brief
timeline of a discussion with a developer about the proposed project. Vaughn has asked
Anderson Engineering to do the civil engineering for the project. The property is currently out
of city limits but is in the process of annexing into the city. Per contract, Anderson is required to
ask permission to do engineering work for project work like this in city limits.

Prior to the meeting, Zeb spoke with Jason at Anderson Engineering and another developer who
is working on a project east of town on Airport Drive has also requested Anderson to do civil
work for their project. After discussion, David Armstrong made a motion to amend the letter for
approval of engineering services requested by Anderson Engineering to include both projects and
forward to Council for approval. All ayes, motion carried.

Citizen Participation: (not on Agenda) — John Patrick of 1002 Durward Hall addressed the
committee to make them aware of a sidewalk project he feels would be appropriate along River
Street north of Airport Drive to Fairview Avenue. Students coming from the areas of Wendy
Lane, Ridgecrest Ave and Lillie Drive are walking in the right of way in the grass toward the
High School, which in his opinion is not an ideal situation. After discussion, the committee
thanked Mr. Patrick for bringing this to their attention and assured Mr. Patrick that they would
continue looking into it.

Abi Almandinger made an inquiry to the availability of a list of condemned properties and if
those properties are being monitored by anyone on a regular basis. After some clarification
between unfit and condemned properties and general follow up practices by public works code
officials, she further clarified her inquiry to include any monitoring by police. Zeb advised that
Chief Dagnan would be the one to answer her questions.

Staff Reports:
Zeb reported on the following:
Zeb gave a summary of the 5 year Capital Projects for Public Works, Street Department and

Public Health that he has been discussing with Tom for the upcoming budget process. Zeb gave
an update on the status of canvassing the Historic District with Bill Smith to evaluate the



structures and boundaries overall. Jason Shelfer contacted Zeb about a house on Maple Street.
The property has been posted since 2013. Zeb and staff re-inspected, utilities were pulled and
the ‘Unfit’ posting was re-issued. Attempts to meet with the owner to get them some help are
ongoing. Zeb met with Scott Clayton from Habitat for Humanity to discuss several properties
they are trying to get projects moving forward. Zeb met with the County about the Jail project,
he also met with Schreiber’s to discuss their upcoming project and finally, Zeb reported on
completing the Census map updates.

Tom reported on the following:

Tom made mention of the impact that our weather has made on current capital projects, delaying
many of those. At the next Council meeting the Vacca project annexation is expected to be
finalized; parameters are being discussed in a memorandum of understanding about
improvements at Hazel/49. Tom gave an update on the Governor’s cost share project. The
Governor’s office has sent notification that the city has been awarded funds for the cost share
roundabout project located at Russell Smith Way. The scope of the project has changed and it is
unknown at this time if this will affect the cost share.

Ceri Otero made a motion to adjourn the meeting at 7:15 p.m. All ayes, motion carried.
























MEETING NOTICE

CARTHAGE TREE BOARD

DATE: TUESDAY, March 3, 2020

TIME: 4:00 PM

LOCATION: CARTHAGE PARKS DEPARTMENT
MUNICIPAL PARK
720 ROBERT ELLIS YOUNG DRIVE
CARTHAGE, MO 64836

TENTATIVE AGENDA

1. Finalize plan for Arbor Day April 3, 2020

2. Set next meeting date and adjourn

PERSONS WITH DISABILITIESWHO NEED SPECIAL ASSISTANCE CALL 417-237-7000 (VOICE) OR 1-
800-735-2466 (TDD VIA RELAY MISSOURI) AT LEAST 24 HOURS PRIOR TO MEETING.

Posted:

By:







CARTHAGE PUBLIC LIBRARY BOARD OF TRUSTEES
Monday, March 9, 2020 5:15 p.m.

CARTHAGE PUBLIC LIBRARY BOARD ROOM
612 S. Garrison Ave.

AGENDA
Roll Call of Members

Minutes of the Last Meeting

Financial Report

Director’'s Progress and Service Report
President’s Message

Council Liaison’s Report

Committee Reports
Building Committee

Budget Committee
Community Relations
By-Laws
Library Gardens
ADA Compliance
Communications
New Business
Payment of Bills

Adjournment















Sixth, the Chair should determined if any member of the body wishes to second the motion. The Chair should
announce the name of the member of the body who seconds the maotion, (It is normatly good practice for a motion to
require a second before proceeding with it, to ensure that it is not just one member of the body who is interested ifx a
particular approach. However, a second is not an absolute requirement, and the Chair can proceed with consideration
and vote on a motion even when there is ne second. This is a matter Jeft to the discretion of the Chair.)

Seventh, if the motion is made and seconded, the Chair should make sure everyone understands the motion. This is
done in one of three ways: (1) The Chair can ask the maker of the motion to repeat it. (2) The Chair can repeat the
motion. (3) The Chair can ask the sceretary or the clesk of the body to repeat the motion.

Eighth, the Chair should now invite discussion of the motion by the body. If there is no desired discussion, or after the
discussion has ended, the Chair should announce that the body will vote on the motion. If there has been no discussion
or very brief discussion, then the vote on the motion should proceed immediately and there is no need to repeat the
motion. If there has been substantial discussion, then it is normally best to make sure everyone understands the motion
by repeating it.

Ninth, the Chair takes a vote. Simply asking for the “ayes", and then asking for the "nays" normally does this. If
members of the body do not vote, then they "abstain”. Unless the rules of the body provide otherwisc (or unless a
super-majority is required as delincated later in these rules) then a simple majority determines whether the motion
passes or is defeated.

Tenth, the Chair should announce the result of the vote and should announce what action (if any) the body has taken.
In announcing the result, the Chair should indicate the names of the members of the body, if any, who voted in the
minority on the motion. This announcement might take the following form: "The motion passes by a vote of 3-2, with
Smith and Jones dissenting. We have passed the motion requiring 10 days notice for all future meetings of this body.”

Motions in General

Motions are the vehicles for decision-making by a body. It is usually best to have a motion before the body prior to
commencing discussion of an agenda item. This helps the body focus.

Motions are made in a simple two-step process. First, the Chair should recognize the member of the body. Second, the
member of the body makes a motion by preceding the member's desired approach with the words: "I move . .. . "
So, a typical motion might be: "I move that we give 10-day's notice in the future for all our meetings.”

The Chair usually initiates the motion by either (1) Inviting the members of the bady to make a motion. "A motion at
this time would be in order.” (2) Suggesting a motion to the members of the body. "A motion would be in order that
we give 10-day’s notice in the future for all our meetings." (3) Making the motion. As noted, the Chair has every right
as a member of the body 1o make a motion, but should normally do so only if the Chair wishes to make a motion on an
item but is convinced that no other member of the body is willing to step forward to do so at a particular time.

The Three Basic Motions

There are three motions that are the most common and recur often at meetings:

The basic_motion. The basic motion is the one that puts forward a decision for the body's consideration. A basic
motion might be: "I move that we create a S-member committee to plan and put on our annual fundraiser.”

The motion to amend. If @ member wants to change a basic motion that is before the body, they would move to
amend it. A motion to amend might be: "I move that we amend the motion to have a 10-member committee.” A
motion to amend takes the basic motion which is before the body and seeks to change it in some way.

The substitute maotion. If a member wants to completely do away with the basic motion that is before the body, and
put a new motion before the body, they would move a substitute motion. A substitute motion might be: "I move a
substitute motion that we cancel the annual fundraiser this year."

"Motions to amend” and "substitute motions" are often confused. But they are quite different, and their effect (if
passed) is quite different. A motion to amend seeks to relain the basic motion on the floor, but modify it in some way.
A substitute motion secks to throw out the basic motion on the floar, and substitute a new and different motion for it.
The decision as t0 whether a motion is really a "motion to amend" or a “substitute motion" is left to the chair. So that if
a member makes what that member calls a "motion to amend", but the Chair determines that it is really a "substitutc
motion”, then the Chair's designation governs.

Multiple Motions Before the Body

There can be up to three motions on the floor at the same time. The Chair can reject a fourth motion until the Chair has
dealt with the three that are on the floor and has resolved them.

When there are two or three motions on the floor (after motions and seconds) at the same time, the vote should proceed
first on the last motion that is made. So, for example, assume the first motion is & basic "motion to have a S-member
committee to plan and put on our annual fundraiser.” During the discussion of this motion, @ member might make a
second motion to "amend the main motion ta have a 10-member commitiee, not a S-member commiitee to plan and put



on our annual fundraiser.” And perhaps, during that discussion, 8 member makes yet a third motion as a "substitute
motion that we not have an annuel fundraiser this year." The proper procedure would be as follows:

First, the Chair would deal with the third (the last) motion on the floor, the substitute motion. After discussion and
debate, a vote would be taken first on the third motion. If the substitute motion passed, it would be a substitute for the
basic motion and would eliminate it. The first motion would be moot, as would the second motion (which sought to
amend the first motion), and the action on the agenda item would be completed on the passage by the body of the third
motion (the substitute motion). No vote would be taken on the first or second motions, On the other hand, if the
substitute motion (the third motion) failed then the Chair would proceed to consideration of the second (now, the last)
moton on the floor, the motion to amend.
Second, if the substitute motion failed, the Chair would now deal with the second (now, the last) motion on the floor,
the motion to amend, The discussion and debate would focus strictly on the amendment (should the commitiee by 5
members or 10 members). If the motion to amend passed the Chair would now move to consider the main motion (the
first motion) as amended. If the motion to amend failed the Chair would now move to consider the main motion (the
first motion) in its original format, not amended.
Third, the Chair would now deal with the first motion that was placed on the floor. The original motion would either
be in its original format (S-member commitee), or, if amended, would be in its amended format (10-member
committee). And the question on the floor for discussion and decision would be whether a commitice should plan and
put on the annual fundraiser.

To Debate or Not to Debate
The basic rule of motions is that they are subject to discussion and debate. Accordingly, basic motions, metions to
amend, and substitute motions are all eligible, each in their tum, for full discussion before and by the body. The debate
can continue as long as members of the body wish to discuss an item, subject to the decision of the Chair that it is time
to move on and take action.
There are exceptions to the general rule of free and open debate on motions. The exceptions all apply when there is a

desire of the body to move on. The following motions are not debatable (that is, when the following motions are made
and seconded, the Chair must immediately call for a vote of the body without debate on the motion):

A _motion to adjourn. This motion, if passed, requires the body to immediately adjourn to its next regularly scheduled
meeting. It requires a simple majority vote.

A_motion_to recess. This motion, if passed, requires the body to immediately take a recess. Normally, the Chair
determines the length of the recess which may be a few minutes or an hour. 1t requires a simple majority vote.

A motion to fix the time to adjourn. This motion, if passed, requires the bedy to adjourn the meeting at the specific
time set in the motion. For example, the motion might be: "I move we adjourn this meeting at midnight.” It requires a

simple majority vote.

A motion to table. This motion, if passed, requires discussion of the agenda item to be halted and the agenda item to
be placed on "hold”. The motion can contain a specific time in which the item can come back to the body: “I move we
table this item until our regular meeting in October." Or the motion can contain no specific time for the return of the
item, in which case a motion to take the item off the table and bring it back to the body will have to be taken at a future
meeting. A motion to table an item (or to bring it back to the body) requires a simple majority vote.

A motion to limit debate. The most common form of this motion is to say: "I move the previous question® or "I move
the question" or "I call the question.” When a member of the body makes such a motion, the member is really saying:
“I've had enough debate. Let's get on with the vote". When such a motion is made, the Chair should ask for a second,
stop debate, and vote on the motion to limit debate. The motion to limit debate requires a 2/3 vote of the body. Note:
that a motion to limit debate could include a time limit, For example: "I move we limit debate on this agenda item to
15 minutes." Even in this format, the motion to limit debate requires a 2/3 vote of the body. A similar motion is a
motion to object to consideration of an item. This motion is not debatable, and if passed, precludes the body from even
considering an item on the agenda. It also requires a 2/3 vote.

Majority and Super-Majority Votes
In a democracy, a simple majority vote determines a question. A tie vote means the motion fails. So in a 7-member
body, a vote of 4-3 passes the motion. A vote of 3-3 with one abstention means the motion fails. If one member is
absent and the vote is 3-3, the motion still fails.
All motions require a simple majority, but there are a few exceptions. The exceptions come up when the body is taking
an action which, effectively, cuts off the ability of a minority of the body to take an action or discuss and itcm. These
extraordinary motions require a 2/3 majority (a super-majority) to pass:
Motion to limit debate. Whether a member says "I move the previous question” or "I move the question” or "I call the
question" or "I move to limit debate®, it all amounts to an attempt to cut off the ability of the minority to discuss an
iter, and it requires a 2/3 vote to pass.










