




















COUNCIL BILL NO. _20-07 ORDINANCE NO.

An Ordinance authorizing the Mayor to execute a Contract between the City of Carthage, Missouri
and CDL Electric of Pittsburg, Kansas for lighting improvements and upgrades at City Hall.

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF CARTHAGE, JASPER
COUNTY, MISSOURI as follows:

SECTION I: The Mayor of the City of Carthage is hereby authorized to execute a Contract
between the City of Carthage, Missouri and CDL Electric of Pittsburg, Kansas for lighting
improvements and upgrades at City Hall, which Contract is attached hereto and incorporated
herein as if set out in full.

SECTION II: This ordinance shall take effect and be in force from and after its passage and
approval.

PASSED AND APPROVED THIS DAY OF March 2020.

Dan Rife, Mayor

ATTEST:

Traci Cox, City Clerk

Sponsored hy: Public Works Committee






COUNCIL BILL NO. _ 20-08 ORDINANCE NO.

An ordinance adopting and amending APPENDIX H (Signs) of the International Building
Code/2006.

Section I: The publication known as the International Building Code/2006 Appendix H,
as published and by the International Code Council, Inc. and amended is hereby adopted for the
control, installation, and placement of signs herein provided; and each and all of the regulations,
provisions, penalties, conditions, amendments, and terms of said Appendix H are hereby referred
to, adopted, and made part hereof as fully set out in ordinance, with additions, insertions, deletions,
and changes, prescribed in Section 11 of this ordinance.

Section II: That the International Building Code/2000 Appendix Hand all other ordinances
or parts of ordinances in conflict herewith are hereby repealed.

Section III:
Section H101.2 DELETE: 1. Painted nonilluminated signs.
Section H104 DELETE: Identification (complete section)
Section H107.1.3 DELETE: Area Limitations (complete Section)
Section H110.4 DELETE: Height of open signs (complete section)
Section H110.5 DELETE: Height of closed signs (complete section)
Section H113 DELETE: Marquee signs (complete section)
Section H106.1 DELETE: ICC and INSERT: NEC
Section H106.2 DELETE: ICC and INSERT: NEC
Section H107.1.2 DELETE: 200 square feet INSERT: 120 square feet
Section H109.1 DELETE: greater than 100 feet (30,480 mm) INSERT: 45 feet
Section H110.3 DELETE: solid INSERT: Roof
Section H110.3 DELETE: having a solid surface

Section H109 INSERT: H109.4 Ground signs shall be permitted only when they
advertise products or services sold on the premises on which said sign is located; when
they advertise products or services sold by the owner of the ground sign; or when they
display directions or advertise information about public places; historic homes; historic
sites; historic districts; historic museums; municipal buildings; and hospitals, etc.



H109.5 Ground signs with two (2) faces or less shall not have more than 120 square
feet per face, except those located along four lane divided, limited access highways.
Ground signs located along said highways shall not have more than 200 square feet per
face.

H109.6 Ground signs with multiple faces constructed on either side or on the same
side of uprights or supports shall not have more than 120 square feet per side.

H109.7 Ground signs having three (3) or four (4) faces attached to the same upright
or supports at the same elevation shall not have more than 50 square feet per face. Messages
board areas which are 60 square feet or less that are located on the same uprights or
supports of any ground sign, shall not be considered to be part of the sign face. Message
board areas of more than 60 square feet located on the same uprights or supports shall not
be allowed.

H109.8 No more than one (1) ground sign shall be allowed for commercial or non-
commercial premises on which said signs are located, unless said premises lie adjacent to
more than one city street, county highway, state highway, or federal highway. No more
than one (1) additional ground sign shall be allowed in such cases.

SECTION IV: This Ordinance shall take effect and be in force from and after its passage
and approval.

PASSED AND APPROVED THIS _ DAY OF , 2020.
Dan Rife, Mayor
ATTEST:
Traci Cox, City Clerk

Sponsored by: Public Works Committee



























AGREEMENT FORM oot s o e aiiam s S st i ainin i s 00500

THIS AGREEMENT, made this day of , 2020, by and between City of Carthage,
Carthage, Missouri, hereinafter called "OWNER" and _G & G Construction Co., Inc. doing business as (ar
individual), or (a-partrership,) or (a corporation) hereinafter called "CONTRACTOR".

WITNESSETH: That for and in consideration of the payments and agreements hereinafter mentioned:

1. The CONTRACTOR will commence and complete the construction of River Street Widening and
Stormwater, Carthage, Missouri.

2. The CONTRACTOR will furnish all of the materials, supplies, tools, equipment, labor and other
services necessary for the construction and completion of the PROJECT described herein.

3. The CONTRACTOR will commence the work required by the CONTRACT DOCUMENTS on the date
stipulated in the NOTICE TO PROCEED and will complete the same within ninety (90) calendar days unless
the period for completion is extended otherwise by the CONTRACT DOCUMENTS.

4. The CONTRACTOR understands that the specifications governing the work contemplated are attached
to this proposal.

5. The CONTRACTOR agrees to pay, without condition or recourse, as liquidated damages to the sum of
Five Hundred and 00/100 dollars ($500.00) for each consecutive calendar day after the stated DATE OF
COMPLETION or extension thereto that the CONTRACTOR shall be in default as provided in SECTION
15 OF THE General Conditions. CONTRACTOR further agrees to reimburse the subcontractors, suppliers,
engineers, and other contractors of the OWNER for costs incurred and/or damages suffered by reason or
reasons attributable to the CONTRACTOR'S failure to complete the CONTRACT by the completion date,
or extensions thereof, as provided by section 15 of the General Conditions. Said liquidated damages and
payments shall be withheld from the payments due the contractor. The CONTRACTOR agrees to perform
all of the WORK described in the CONTRACT DOCUMENTS and comply with the terms therein for the
sum of Two Hundred Forty-One Thousand Sixteen and 14/100 Dollars ($241.016.14).

6. Theterm "CONTRACT DOCUMENTS" means and includes the following:
(A) Invitation to Bid
(B) Instructions to Bidders
(C) Bid
D) Bid Bond
E) Agreement Form
F) Notice of Award
) Notice to Proceed
) Performance Bond
Payment bond
J) General Conditions of Contract
K) SupplementaryConditions
) Specifications prepared by Anderson Engineering, Inc. and dated February, 2020.
) Drawings prepared by Anderson Engineering, Inc. and dated February, 2020.

G
H
1)

(
(
(
(
(
(
(
(
(L
(M
(

N) Addenda
No. 1 dated February 12 2020
No. 2 dated February 14 20 20
No. 3 dated February 24 2020
No. dated 20
No. dated 20__

00500-1






NOTICE OF AWARD

TO: G & G Construction Co., Inc.

P.O. Box 863

Carthage, Missouri 64836

PROJECT Description: River Street Widening & Stormwater, Carthage, Missouri.

The OWNER has considered the BID submitted by you for the above described WORK in response
to its Invitation to Bid dated February 5, 2020 and Instructions to Bidders.

You are hereby notified that you BID has been accepted in the amount of Two Hundred Forty-One
Thousand Sixteen and 14/100 Dollars ($241,016.14).

You are required by the Instructions to Bidders to execute the Agreement and furnish the required
CONTRACTORS PERFORMANCE BOND, PAYMENT BOND and CERTIFICATES OF INSURANCE
within fourteen (14) consecutive calendar days from the date of this Notice to you.

If you fail to execute said Agreement and to furnish said BONDS and INSURANCE
CERTIFICATES within fourteen (14) consecutive calendar days from the date of this Notice, said OWNER
will be entitled to consider all your rights arising out of the OWNER'S acceptance of your BID as
abandoned and as a forfeiture of your BID BOND. The OWNER will be entitled to such other rights as may
be granted by law.

You are required to return an acknowledged copy of this NOTICE OF AWARD to the OWNER.

Dated this day of , 20
City of Carthage
By:
Title:__Mayor
ACCEPTANCE OF NOTICE

Receipt of the above NOTICE OF AWARD s hereby acknowledged by
this the day of 20

By,

Title

501-1






COUNCIL BILL NO. _20-10 ORDINANCE NO.

An Ordinance authorizing the Mayor to execute a Contract between the City of Carthage, Missouri
and Sprouls Construction, Inc., of Lamar, Missouri for Storm water Improvement projects in an
amount not to exceed $207,240.00.

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF CARTHAGE, JASPER
COUNTY, MISSOURI as follows:

SECTION I: The Mayor of the City of Carthage is hereby authorized to execute a Contract
between the City of Carthage, Missouri and Sprouls Construction, Inc., of Lamar, Missouri for
Storm water Improvement projects in an amount not to exceed $207,240.00, pursuant to bid
specifications and recommendation, which Contract is attached hereto and incorporated herein as
if set out in full.

SECTION II: This ordinance shall take effect and be in force from and after its passage and

approval.

PASSED AND APPROVED THIS DAY OF March 2020.
Dan Rife, Mayor

ATTEST:

Traci Cox, City Clerk

Sponsored by: Public Works Committee














































































The Carthage Public Library Board of Trustees Meeting Minutes — February 2020

2020 at 1:00 pm, which Gary will attend. G & G will bring in a contractor to do the work as soon as the
paperwork is in place. Two guestions Gary is working on: 1) will the warranty stay in place after/when they fix
the issue around the drain and 2) how long are we protected by the bond.

Budget Committee — No report.
Community Relations — No report.
By-Laws - No report.

Library Gardens — Miriam contacted Pinewood Nursery and will review the landscaping plans before
the next board meeting.

ADA Compliance — No report.

Communications — There has been no further contact with the patron who filed a complaint with Eric
Putnam however Julie did say the patron has been in the Library multiple times since and has made no effort
to talk with the Director or the board President.

Unfinished Business
No report.

New Business
No report.

Payment of Bills
Peggy Ralston said she had reviewed the bills and they could be paid. Eric Putnam made a motion to pay the
bills. Donna Maggard seconded. Motion passed unanimously.

Other New Business
No report.

Adjournment
Gary Cole made a motion to adjourn. Eric Putnam seconded. Motion passed unanimously. Meeting was
adjourned at 5:47 pm.

Ree// psetfully SW
e . A7 D .
hsoh

evin Johns
Secretary-Treasurer














































































CITY OF CARTHAGE
FISCAL YEAR JULY 1, 2020 - JUNE 30, 2021

AGENCY REQUEST FOR FUNDS FORM
Type of Funds Requested: General - Lodging - Other (please circle)

NAME OF AGENCY: Carthage Chamber of Commerce

AMOUNT OF FUNDS REQUESTED: § 118,075.00

Please provide the following information:

1. Copy of detailed operating budget for Fiscal Year 2020 - 2021, income, expenses,
and beginning and ending balances.
2. Copy of detailed operating budget for Fiscal Year 2019 - 2020, income, expenses,
and beginning and ending balances.
If you have reserves in an earmarked account, you may wish to attach an additional page of explanation
along with individual account balances projected at the beginning and end of the fiscal year. If the reserves are
legally earmarked for a specific purpose, please provide an explanation and authorization.

3. Copy of organizational document, e.g. 501 (c) (3) certificates.
4. Copy of By-laws.
5. Listing of current Board of Directors.

What is the intended use of the funds should they be provided? Please itemize:

Funds will be used for providing Economic Development programs and services for the City of
Carthage as outlined in the agreement between the City of Carthage and the Carthage
Chamber of Commerce. Work Plan is attached with this document.

Return form and attachments to City Administrator, 326 Grant Street, Carthage, MO 64836 by March 13, 2020

P16




FY 2021 Economic Development Work Plan

Economic development priorities for FY 2021 year will be the following:

Myers Park - As in previous years, our recommendation to the City is to develop the
Myers Park area into a mixed-use area. Currently the City owns 37 acres plus there
are additional acreages of 6.5 owned by Eli Bruton (he has sold 2 acres which will be
used as a retail business) and 4.5 acres owned by the Lim’s, Root Zero 3. Carthage
does not have the traffic or population volume many national or regional retail
businesses look for in considering new locations. For years Joplin has been and
continues to be the major retail hub because of their population and traffic numbers.
Since Myers Park was developed the focus has been to place retail businesses in that
area. Due to the amount of time that has passed and lack of prospects the time for the
retail-only development philosophy has passed. The buying pattern of individuals
continues to change. It is a mix of online and brick and mortar purchasing. The
online retailers are looking at adding brick and mortar, but that is primarily occurring
in larger cities. The traffic count is still the biggest measuring factor when companies
are looking to add stores. By allowing 25 acres to be used for apartments, senior
living, townhouses, etc., there are still 12 acres owned by the City plus 13 acres held
by the above-mentioned owners that can be used for retail. That is a total 25 acres
available for retail development. Additionally, another 24 acres are available in the
Peachtree subdivision. That totals approximately 50 acres available for retail
development. The plan to turn 25 acres into housing will start by contacting several
multi-housing developers. Until the council gives the go ahead to pursue the mixed
option, direct contact with developers cannot occur. Marketing of the property would
include signage in the area promoting both retail and housing options. Some
advertising can be done media wise based upon local and regional opportunities. This
includes recruitment of niche retail, entertainment establishments, grocery stores,
and restaurants to support the workforce and benefit area citizens.

Industrial Park - As the Schreiber distribution center continues to progress, more
investigation will be done into the possible development of the remaining 30 acres m/l to
the north of this project. This parcel allows several opportunities for Carthage. First, by
annexing this property into the City limits, it eliminates another non-annexed pocket.
Secondly, as most of the properties are in dis-repair, this allows for urban renewal
improvements that will help not only the residents, but Carthage as a destination for
business. Research is needed to determine the mechanics of the improvement process
and what State/Federal funds are available to assist in this project. Finally, an additional
30 acres m/] can be used for a small industrial park. This can provide a short-term option
towards development of a larger industrial park. If an industrial park is truly a top
priority for the City of Carthage, funds need to be provided by the local government
entities to purchase and develop a site. If the City desires not to provide financial
resources, the idea of an industrial park should be abandoned, and the Chamber will work
in conjunction with the MOKAN Partnership to promote the existing industrial sites in
the area.

P17


































Carthage Public Library
Balance Sheet - Cash basis
February 29, 2020

Current Assets
Cash in bank - treasurer's cash
Cash in bank - Simmons Bank
Cash in bank - Community National Bank
Cash on hand - circulation desk
Cash on hand - Intemet desk
Petty cash
MOSIP Investment

Total Current Assets

Total Assets

Liabilities and Net Assets

Net Assets
Unrestricted Net Assets

Temporarily Restricted Net Assets:
Boylan Grant
CPL Development Foundation
Debbie Putnam - Ebooks
Debbie Putnam - Children's section
Library Gardens
Spotlight on Literacy (RTR) Grant - MOSL 2020
Spotlight on Literacy (RTR) Grant - Local 2020
Spotlight on Literacy - MOSL -2020
Spotlight on Literacy Grent - Local - 2020
Steadley Trust
Summer reading program - Local - 2019
Summer reading program - MOSL grant - 2019
Thelma Stanley Foundation Grant
Operational reserves
Change in net assets

Total Net Assets

Total Liabilities and Net Assets

See accountant's compilation report.

Assets

2

$ 471,314.10
28,125.43
111,425.63

100.00

40.00

120.00

__ seraam

1,278,589.93

$ 1!278!589.93

$ 579,161.12

6,252.67
13,048.92
30,139.74

2,000.00
13,403.70
4,397.25
7,735.57
2,189.25
13,778.65
2,546.16
75.18
(2,489.79)
7,012.56
195,998.47
403,340.08

.
175895

s 127850993




Revenue

Book sale income
Copier income
Donations
Donations-restricted

Fax income

Fine income

Interest income
Non-resident fee income
Payment for lost books
Postage income

State aid

Sur tax

Tax income

Tax income - Park and storm water
Miscellaneous Income
Other income

Total revenue

Carthage Public Library
Statements of Income and Other Changes in Net Assets - Cash basis

For the one month and eight months ended February 29, 2020

2020 Monthly Monthly 2020 Annual Annual
Month Actual Budget Variance Year to date Budget Variance

$ 80.50 $ 250,00 (169.50) $ 1,295.65 3,000.00 (1,704.35)

495.20 58334 (88.14) 4,547.90 7,000.00 (2,452.10)

247.17 0.00 247.17 13,422.65 0.00 13,422.65

1,500.00 1,125.00 375.00 445,062.96 13,500.00 431,562.96

44.20 83.34 (39.14) 673.60 1,000.00 (326.40)

438.39 583.34 (144.95) 4,829.81 7,000.00 (2,170.19)

1,519.15 83334 685.81 38,438.99 10,000.00 28,438.99

440,00 666.67 (226.67) 4,420.00 8,000.00 (3,580.00)

12.44 0.00 12.44 366.52 0.00 366.52

0.00 166.67 (166.67) 4.50 2,000.00 (1,995.50)

0.00 1,000.00 (1,000.00) 4,854.79 12,000.00 (7,145.21)

0.00 1,500.00 (1,500.00) 3,511.21 18,000.00 (14,488.79)

2,675.43 16,916.67 (14,241.29) 203,388.73 203,000.00 388.73

37,562.36 38,966.67 (1,404.31) 312,390.44 467,600.00 (155,209.56)

0,00 166.67 (166.67) 1,708.72 2,000.00 (291.28)

37.35 166.67 (129.32) 665.45 2,000.,00 (1,334.55)

45,052.19 63,008.38 (17,956.19) 1,039,581.92 756,100.00 283,481.92

See accountant's compilation report.

3



Operating Expenses
Salaries
Lagers
Insurance - health
Payroll taxes - FICA

Total payroll expenses

Employee goodwill
Advertising
Audio-visuals
Books
Books -~ children’s
Contract fees
Dues and travel
Ebooks
Fumniture and equipment
Information technology (IT)
Insurance
Interest expense
Legal and professional
Multi purpose building
Periodicals
Postage
Programs - adult
Programs - children
Programs, teens
Repairs and maintenance
Supplies
Telephone
Utilities

Total expenses and losses

Carthage Public Library
Statements of Income and Other Changes in Net Assets - Cash basis

For the one month and eight months ended February 29, 2020

2020 Monthly Monthly 2020 Annual Annual

Month Actual Budget Variance Year to date Budget Variance
34,347.43 40,509.66 6,162.23 324,827.27 486,116.00 161,288.73
1,782.54 1,959.91 177.37 16,766.53 23,519.00 6,752.47
700.00 1,250.00 550.00 6,936.92 15,000.00 B,063.08
2,628.15 3,042.91 414.76 24,853.30 36,515.00 11,661.70
39,458.12 46,762.48 7,304.36 373,384.02 561,150.00 187,765.98
0.00 250.00 250.00 2,744.64 3,000.00 255.36
0.00 8333 83.33 384.90 1,000.00 615.10
284.40 166.66 (117.74) 903.71 2,000.00 1,096.29
1,579.95 2,500.00 920.05 17,669.71 30,000.00 12,330.29
184.64 1,250.00 1,065.36 11,106.13 15,000.00 3,893.87
1,501.98 3,083.33 1,581.35 27,491.54 37,000.00 9,508.46
336.12 83333 497.21 4,101.28 10,000.00 5,898.72
0.00 291.66 291.66 3,500.00 3,500.00 0.00
0.00 583.33 583.33 514.19 7,000.00 6,485.81
1,183.51 583.33 (600.18) 1,914.99 7,000.00 5,085.01
0.00 2,083.33 2,083.33 26,841.00 25,000.00 (1,841.00)
1.98 0.00 (1.98) 1.98 0.00 (1.98)
0.00 500.00 500.00 7,225.00 6,000,00 (1,225.00)
29,344.89 0.00 (29,344.89) 74,007.71 0.00 (74,007.71)
348.99 500.00 151.01 4,230.72 6,000.00 1,769.28
0.00 125.00 125.00 594.68 1,500.00 905.32
179.33 500.00 320.67 3,786.36 6,000.00 2,213.64
1,662.99 1,083.33 (579.66) 5,106.85 13,000.00 7,893.15
0.00 83.33 83.33 325.79 1,000.00 674.21
701.94 2,916.66 2,214.72 30,671.32 35,000.00 4,328.68
2,011.50 2,083.33 71.83 14,205.34 25,000.00 10,794.66
399.64 500.00 100.36 3,495.84 6,000.00 2,504.16
3,303.42 2,916.66 (386.76) 22,034.14 35,000.00 12,965.86
43,025.28 22,916.61 (20,108.67) 262,857.82 275,000.00 12,142.18
82,483.40 69,679.09 (12,804.31) 636,241.84 836,150.00 159,908.16

See accountant's compilation report.

4



g
“yodas uonepdwod SJUEUNoIe 335

0L7£v2'59 000 0L77vC'99 T68°6669) €10 (9£76669) 59558 Jau paMIsalun Ul (aseanag)/eseanu]
(96°290'5t+) 000 (96'290'5tb) (00°005'T) 000 (00'005'T) pajousal Aresodwa) 0} s13jsuelL
85°026'£Z 0005008 85°0£6'£01 19°092'5Z b8'0£9'9 SY'TE6TE papinsA Arelodwa) woy SIjsuell
B80'06£'€8Y (00"050'08) 80°0bE'E0p (05°092'08) (1°0£9'9) (1 1ey'se) sijsuen 2i0j2q
5jass5e JoU papLIsAIUN U (35EAN3Q)/esENU]
RouRHEeA jebpng ajep 03 Jea) [ouRUep jabpng [enpPy PUoW
|enuuy |enuuy 0zoz Appuop Ajpguop 0zoz

0z0zZ ‘6z Aeniged papu@ syjuow Jybe pue Yyuow duo 3 104
siseq yse) - s3assy 19N uj sabuey) J9Yy30 pue JWooU] JO SJUSWRES
Aseiqry olgnd ab6eyped







Carthage Public Library

Gift Account Activity

For the one month and eight months ended February 29, 2020

Boylan Grant

CPL Development Foundation

CLSP Grant

Debbie Putnam - Ebooks

Debbie Putnam - Children's section
Librry Gardens

Spatlight on Literacy (RTR) Grant - MOSL 2020
Spotiight on Literacy (RTR) Grant - Local 2020

Spotlight on Literacy - MOSL -2020
Spatiight on Literacy Grant - Local - 2020
Steadley Trust

Summer reading program - Local - 2019

Summer Reading Program-Local Funds 02/2020-
08/2020

Summer reading program - MOSL grant - 2019
Thema Stanley Foundation Grant
Mutti Purpose Building - furnishings and supplies
Mult Purpose Building
Operational reserves

Totals

Beginning Ending
Balance Increases Decreases balance
$ 6,252.67 $ 0.00 0.00 6,252.67
13,048.92 0.00 (2,597.37) 10,451.55
0.00 0.00 (185.95) (185.95)
30,139.74 0.00 (3,500.00) 26,639.74
2,000.00 (2,000.00) 0.00 0.00
13,403.70 0.00 (3,875.42) 9,528.28
4,397.25 4,258.00 (3,202.35) 5,452.90
7,735.57 0.00 (2,120.57) 5,615.00
2,189.25 6,776.00 (11,598.75) (2,633.50)
13,778.65 0.00 (2,808.71) 10,969.94
2,546.16 0.00 (1,620.00) 926.16
75.18 515.00 (590.18) 0.00
0.00 1,500.00 0.00 1,500.00
(2,489.79) 4,398.12 (1,908.33) 0.00
7,012.96 0.00 0.00 7,012.96
0.00 244,282.50 0.00 244,282.50
0.00 185,333.34 (73,962.95) 111,370.39
195,998.47 0.00 0.00 195,998.47
$ 296,088.73 ] 445,062.96 (107,970.58) 633,181.11

8

See accountant's compilation report.









Children’s Progress Report
February 2020, Sherri Luce

This February, we were in contact with 579 community members
through Children’s and Family programming. That is over 100 more than
this time last year! These programs included eight in-house English
programs, eight outreach English programs, and one bilingual in-house
program. (The Presidents’ Day holiday and a late opening day limited our
bilingual programming this month.)

Our Winter Reading Program finished with 107 children and teens
signed up, and 26 of those completing the entire board (five rows). Several
others completed 3-4 rows. The 1,000 Books Before Kindergarten Program
will be ongoing, and at this point there are 53 toddlers enrolled with 11,
100 book logs having been turned in already. Some of those are repeats,
as one young man has read 300 books since January 14t

March is well underway with scheduled programs including English
and bilingual story times, reading with the therapy dog, Asha, LEGO
building club, and our regular outreach programs. Summer reading
program calendars are also in the works, as that will be here before we
know it! We will begin sign-ups around June 1%, with our first large
program being scheduled for June 9, The Fishing Magicians.









Sixth, the Chair should determined if any member of the body wishes 1o second the motion. The Chair should
announce the name of the member of the body who seconds the motion. (It is normally good practice for & motion to
require a second before proceeding with it, to ensure that it is not just one member of the body whoa is interested in a
particular approach. However, a second is not an absolute requirement, and the Chair can proceed with consideration
and vote on a motion even when there is no second. This is a matter Jeft to the discretion of the Chair.)

Seventh, if the motion is made and seconded, the Chair should make sure cveryone understands the motion. This is
done in one of three ways: (1) The Chair can ask the maker of the motion to repeat it. (2) The Chair can repeat the
motion. (3) The Chair can ask the sccretary or the clerk of the body to repeat the motion.

Eighth, the Chair should now invite discussion of the motion by the body. If there is no desired discussion, or after the
discussion has ended, the Chair should announce that the body will vote on the motion. If there has been no discussion
or very brief discussion, then the voie on the motion should proceed immediately and there is no need to repeat the
motion. If there has been substantial discussion, then it is normally best to make sure everyone understands the motion
by repeating it.

Ninth, the Chair takes a vote. Simply asking for the "ayes", and then asking for the "nays" normally does this. If
members of the body do not vote, then they "abstain". Unless the rules of the body provide otherwise (or unless a
super-majority is required as delineated later in these rules) then a simple majority determines whether the motion
passes or is defeated.

Tenth, the Chair should announce the result of the vote and should announce what action (if any) the body has taken.
In announcing the result, the Chair should indicate the names of the members of the body, if any, who voted in the
minority on the motion. This announcement might take the following form: "The motion passes by a vote of 3-2, with
Smith and Jones dissenting. We have passed the motion requiring 10 days notice for all future meetings of this bedy.”

Motions in General

Motions are the vehicles for decision-making by a body. It is usually best 10 have a motion before the body prior to
commencing discussion of an agenda item. This helps the body focus.

Motions are made in a simple two-step process. First, the Chair should recognize the member of the body. Second, the
member of the body makes a motion by preceding the member's desired approach with the words: "I move ... . "
So, a typical motion might be: "I move that we give 10-day's notice in the future for all our meetings.”

The Chair usually initiates the motion by either (1) Inviting the members of the body to make a motion. "A motion at
this time would be in order.” (2) Suggesting a motion to the members of the body. "A motion would be in order that
we give 10-day’s notice in the future for all our meetings." (3) Making the motion. As noted, the Chair has every right
as a member of the body to make a motion, but should normally do so only if the Chair wishes to make a motion on an
item but is convinced that no other member of the body is willing 1o siep forward to do so at a particular time.

The Three Basic Motions
There are three motions that are the most common and recur often at meetings:

The basic_motion. The basic motion is the one that puts forward a decision for the body's consideration. A basic
motion might be: "1 move that we create a S-member comumittee to plan and put on our annual fundraiser.”

The motion to amend. If 2 member wants fo change a basic motion that is before the body, they would move to
amend it. A motion to amend might be: "I move that we amend the motion to have a [0-mcmber committee.” A
motion to amend takes the basic motion which is before the body and seeks to change it in some way.

The substitute motion. If a member wants to completely do away with the basic motion that is before the body, and
put a new motion before the body, thcy would move a substitute motion. A substitute motion might be: "l move a
substitute motion that we cancel the annual fundraiser this year."

"Motions to amend” and “substitute motions" are often confused. But they are quite different, and their effect (if
passed) is quite different. A motion to amend seeks to relain the basic motion on the floor, but modify it in some way.
A substitute motion seeks 1o throw out the basic motion on the floar, and substitute a new and different motion for it.
The decision as to whether 2 motion is really a "motion to amend" or a “substitute motion" is left to the chair. So that if
a member makes what that member calls a "motion to amend", but the Chair determines that it is really a "substitute
motion", then the Chair's designation governs.

Multiple Motions Before the Body

There can be up to three motions on the floor at the same time. The Chair can reject a fourth motion until the Chair has
dealt with the three that are on the floor and has resolved them.

When there are two or three motions on the floor (after motions and seconds) at the same time, the vote should proceed
first on the last motion that is made. So, for cxample, assume the first motion is a basic “mation to have a 5-member
cammittee to plen and put on our annual fundraiser." During the discussion of this motion, 2 member might make a
second motion to "amend the main motion to have a 10-member committee, not a S-member committee to plan and put












